
 
 

Featured Success Story 

The Story of Danh Vo 

 
We have another success story to share with you.  Messengers of Love organization has  
been working on bringing Danh Vo, a 7 years old boy from a village near Hue, Vietnam, to 
the USA for burn treatment.   He was badly burned from the neck down after  falling into a 
pot of boiling water when he was 3 years old.  MoL members have  been working 
with  the Shriner 's  hospital in Galveston Texas for bringing Danh here for surgery.  Mother 
and child finally arrived in the USA in March this year and the surgery was held in May 
2008.   
  
We are happy to report that the surgery was successful.  The doctor was able to release and 
remove scar tissues in three areas of the body.  The wounds are healing well and Danh can 
now function normally.  He is active and has been able to walk around the house.  He will 
continue to see the doctor regularly for another 6 months until he is completely healed.   His 
mother is his primary caretaker and has done a great job tending to the child.  Both mother 
and child stayed at MoL president’s home, and the boy is going to school to learn English.  
His mother is extremely grateful and had expressed her deep gratitude to MoL organization 
members and sponsors including Dr. Nam Hoang and family, Sister Thu Hang, Ms. Do Lieu, 
Ms. Minh Tam,  and Dr. Cauley and Ms. Theresa Picket for the successful operation.  We at 
Messengers of Love are very happy that we could help Danh and his family and are grateful 
for all those who sponsored and contributed in this effort.   
  
Danh and his mother had returned to Vietnam on March 2009, after a successful surgery and 
recovery.  MoL will continue to support Danh to go to school in his country.  MoL will 
continue with its mission of “making a profound difference in a child 's  life” in  as many 
ways  as we can.  We are active in our work of Love and do need continuous support from 
big-hearted people such as yourself.   
  
May God continue to bless Danh and his family with many abundance and much peace, 
happiness and love.  
 

   
 

 



 
 
 
 

   
 

   
Be Danh Vo- from surgery bed to full recovery 

 

   
MoL President visiting Danh and his family in Vietnam on 2012 

 
 

 


